
Mintz & Gold Launches Accountants’ Liability Practice With Rick Breslow to Lead 

New York New York, September 10, 2019 -- In response to client demand, Mintz & Gold, a full-
service New York City-based law firm, has launched an Accountants’ Liability Practice with 
veteran lawyer Richard (Rick) Breslow as the partner in charge.  

Mintz & Gold’s Accountants’ Liability Practice will defend accounting firms and their personnel 
in civil litigation matters, regulatory investigations (including inquiries by the SEC, PCAOB, 
and State Boards of Accountancy) and professional disciplinary actions.  
 
Senior litigator Rick Breslow, who will lead this new, dedicated practice group, has more than 
30 years of experience advising and defending accounting firms and their personnel, including 
more than 25 years of service in the Office of General Counsel of two different Big 4 accounting 
firms, most recently KPMG.  
 
Rick’s practice will be supported by Mintz & Gold’s broad-based litigation team which includes  
a number of experienced attorneys who are former prosecutors and/or former SEC 
enforcement personnel, who have significant experience representing clients in litigation and 
regulatory matters. 
 
Rick and the other Mintz & Gold litigators are well-versed in complex commercial litigation, 
including defense of litigation under the federal securities laws and SEC investigations. Rick 
also counsels accounting firm clients on a wide variety of legal, compliance and risk 
management issues.  

Co-founding partner Steven Mintz said, “We are excited to broaden our offerings and provide 
our clients with Rick’s specialized, in-demand skill set.”  

Co-founding partner Steven Gold added, “We are expanding across practice areas and Rick 
gives the firm additional accounting and litigation expertise so that we can leverage off of our 
existing platforms including our investigations and litigation teams.” 

Rick Breslow said, “I’m excited to begin the next phase of my career with Mintz & Gold 
launching the Accountants’ Liability Practice. The lawyers here are a talented and collegial team 
and I am looking forward to working with them.”  
 
Earlier this year, the firm added four partners in White Collar Criminal Defense and 
Investigations, Bankruptcy and Restructuring and Media, Intellectual Property, and Freedom of 
Information Laws practice areas and increased its office space by 33%. 

### 

About Mintz & Gold LLP  

Founded in 1993, Mintz & Gold LLP delivers the highest caliber of legal representation at a 
lower cost than traditional firms. We are proud of the high standards established by our firm 
and look forward to continuing our tradition of “true legal counsel.” More information is 
available at www.mintzandgold.com  


